San Bernardino County Request for Proposal No. SDD-059
Department of Public Works - On-Call Maintenance and SPD125 1 SPDADS774
Special Districts Emergency Grading Services Page 36 of 61

ATTACHMENT E - COST / FEE PROPOSAL
CONTRACTOR NAME: Kirtley Construction, inc. dba TK Construction

Contractor: Indicate charges for the equipment and materials by location designated below as a minimum (4 hour minimum
up to 8-hour day). Contractors should also include a complete company price sheet for all equipment that may be of interest
and benefit to the Department. NOTE: Price sheet should include wage rates for foreman/supervision and for other
classifications not included in State Prevailing Wage Classifications.

Foothills High Desert Low Desert | Mountains Valley
{Lytle Creek, {Landers, (Big Bear, Blue (Chino, Fontana,
Glen Helen, (A‘)Bﬂfslﬁey’ Morongo Valley, Jay, Crestline, East Valley: San
Redlands, Hesperia Ph’e!an 28 Palms, Yucca | Running Springs, Bernardino,
Rancho Vi ctgfvillé Trona)’ Valley, Joshua Lake Arrowhead, Yucaipa, Oak
Cucamonga) ! ' Tree) Wrightwood) Glen)
PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR
ITEM | EQUIPMENT {(Equipment {(Equipment and {Equipment and {Equipment and {Equipment and
and Operator) Operator) Operator) Operator) Operator)
Motor Grader . . . . .
1 (14 or equivalent) no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
2 | Front End Loader no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
(950 or equivalent®)
3 | Skip Loader w/ Gannon 684.00 784.00 784.00 684.00 684.00
{750 or equivalent™)
4 | Backhoe 684.00 784.00 784.00 684.00 684.00
(Case, Ford or equivalent®)
5 Dump Truck 624.00 724.00 724.00 624.00 624.00
{all types)
6 | Water Truck 624.00 724.00 724.00 624.00 624.00
(single or double rear axle)
7 Excavator 684.00 784.00 784.00 684.00 684.00
8 Dozer no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Transportation of
9 Equipment 2,064.00 1,032.00 2,064.00 1,032.00 1,032.00
» Include rental equipment hourly rate for various equipment not owned or supplied on supplement sheet,
PER TON PERTON PER TON PER TON PER TON
MATERIALS Includes Includes hauling Includes hauling | Includes hauling | Includes hauling
hauling (25 Mi) (25 Mi) and (25 Mi) and (25 Mi) and {25 Mi) and
and placing placing placing placing placing
Dirt Import
10 ® Includes grading & 125.00 125.00 125.00 125.00 125.00
compaction




San Bernardino County Request for Proposal No. SDD-059
Department of Public Works - On-Call Maintenance and SPD125 / SPDAD5774
Special Districts Emergency Grading Services Page 37 of 61
ATTACHMENT E - COST / FEE PROPOSAL (Cont'd)
Foothills High Desert Low Desert | Mountains Valley
(Lytle Creek, {Landers, (Big Bear, Blue | (Chino, Fontana,
Glen Helen, (ArJB;g?S:;alley, Morongo Valley, Jay, Crestline, East Valley: San
Redlands, Hesperia Fmelan 29 Palms, Yucca | Running Springs, Bernardino,
Rancho Vi ctgi/illé Trona)’ Valley, Joshua l.ake Arrowhead, Yucaipa, Oak
Cucamonga) ’ Tres} Wrightwood) Glen)
PER TON PER TON PERTON PERTON PER TON
MATERIALS (Cont'd) Includes Includes hauling Includes hauling | Includes hauling | Includes hauling
hauling (25 Mi) (25 Mi) and {25 Mi) and {25 Mi) and {25 Mi) and
and placing placing placing placing placing
Class Il import . .
1" * Includes grading and no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
compaction
Class Il Import
@ Includes grading & .
12 compaction (asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
grindings, miscellaneous
base, etc.)
13 | 1/4-Ton Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
14 | 1/2-Ton Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
15 | 3/4-Ton Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
16 | 1-Ton Rock no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Debris R . .
17 Disprcl)salemovm and no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
OTHER
18 | Mobilization no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Any other charges
19 | (explain and provide on no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
separate pricing sheet)

Kirtley Construction, Inc.
dba TK Construction

=

Contractor Name

/\\"uthorized Signaturt

March 18, 2025

Date

David King - Vice President

Print Name
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ATTACHMENT E-1 - SERVICE AREA SCHEDULE

ATTACHMENT E-1
GRADING, DEBRIS REMOVAL & WASHOUT/SUBSIDENCE REPAIR
Contractor: Type or write "X" in the applicable boxes specifying the Service(s) and Area(s) for
which Vendor is willing to supply and travel to as jobs are scheduled or come up.

AREAS
(Noted communities are generalized locations)
Foothills | High Desert | Low Desert | p,,ntains Valley
(Apple Valley, (Landers, Morongo . .
Lytle Creek, G 4 Big Bear, Blue Jay, | (Chino, Fontana,
Weon Tadands | B, s | Vel doPaims, | G Ruming | ot Valy - So
Rancho Cucamonga) Trona) ’ Treg)' Springs, Wrightwood) | Bernardino, Yucaipa
Grading of dirt
roads/easement or X X X X X
properties
Erosion Control X X X X X
S
E | Slope Stabilization X X X X X
R Cleanin
g of Culverts,
Vv Drains, Pipes, efc. X X X X X
1 | pebri
ebris
C | Removal/Disposal X X X X X
E | Material Import X X X X X
S Installation of Barriers
(K-Rails/earth X X X X X
berms)
Traffic Control (as
needed) X X X X X
Explanations:
"\\m
/ M‘%}?ﬁ:% David King - Vice President March 18, 2025

Authorizéd Signature [ ] Print Name [ ] Date
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